AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1191H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 894

To amend MAP-21 to modify provisions relating to a categorical exclusion

for projects of limited Federal assistance, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

May 22, 2025

Ms. Lomuis (for herself and Mr. CRAMER) introduced the following bill; which

To

[E—

O o0 9 N U B W

was read twice and referred to the Committee on Environment and Public
‘Works

A BILL

amend MAP-21 to modify provisions relating to a cat-
ecorical exclusion for projects of limited Federal assist-
ance, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Small Projects Expe-
dited Execution and Delivery Act” or the “SPEED Act”.
SEC. 2. CATEGORICAL EXCLUSION FOR PROJECTS OF LIM-

ITED FEDERAL ASSISTANCE.

Section 1317(1) of MAP-21 (23 U.S.C. 109 note;

Public Law 112-141) is amended—



A~ WL P

2
(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking
“$6,000,000” and inserting “$12,000,000”’; and
(2) in  subparagraph (B), by striking
“$35,000,000” and inserting “$70,000,000”.
O

*S 1894 IS





